

Action Item #7- Agreements

“EXHIBIT D”

EXHIBIT A BID TABULATIONS JUNE 30th, 2008									
Location	Address	Municipal Utility	Chemical	Chemical (%)	Estimated Annual Usage (lbs.)	Unit of Measure	Container Type	Total Delivered Price (per lb.)	
								Jones Chemical	General Chemical
RRWP	15115 River Road Noblesville, IN 46060	Westfield	Hydrofluorosilicic	23	32,910	wet lbs.	bulk**	No Bid	No Bid
RRWP	15115 River Road Noblesville, IN 46060	Westfield	Chlorine	100	9,000	lbs.	1 ton cylinder	0.27	No Bid
CTWP	15405 Cherry Tree Road Noblesville, IN 46060	Westfield	Hydrofluorosilicic	23	15,200	wet lbs.	55 gal drums	No Bid	No Bid
CTWP	15405 Cherry Tree Road Noblesville, IN 46060	Westfield	Chlorine	100	7,200	lbs.	150 lb. cylinders	0.3533	No Bid
NWP	17717 US 31 North Westfield, IN 46074	Westfield	Chlorine	100	2,000	lbs.	150 lb. cylinders	0.3533	No Bid
GHPWP	1140 Greyhound Pass Carmel, IN 46032	Westfield	Chlorine	100	3,500	lbs.	150 lb. cylinders	0.3533	No Bid
W/WTP	3303 W. 166th Street Westfield, IN 46074	Westfield	Aluminum Sulfate	8	216,000	wet lbs.	bulk**	No Bid	0.10234
Plant 3	4425 E. 126th Street Carmel, IN	Carmel	Sodium Fluoride	100	7,000	lbs.	50 lb. bag	0.78	No Bid
Plant 3	4425 E. 126th Street Carmel, IN	Carmel	Chlorine	100	5,000	lbs.	150 lb. cylinder	0.3533	No Bid
Plant 4	10675 N Gray Road Carmel, IN	Carmel	Sodium Fluoride	100	8,000	lbs.	50 lb. bag	0.78	No Bid
Plant 4	10675 N Gray Road Carmel, IN	Carmel	Chlorine	100	4,000	lbs.	1 ton cylinder	0.27	No Bid
Plant 5	5484 E. 126th Street Carmel, IN	Carmel	Sodium Fluoride	100	18,000	lbs.	50 lb. bag	0.78	No Bid
Plant 5	5484 E. 126th Street Carmel, IN	Carmel	Chlorine	100	32,000	lbs.	1 ton cylinder	0.27	No Bid
WTP	5309 South State Road 13 Lapel, IN 46051	Southern Madison	Chlorine	100	1,000	lbs.	150 lb. cylinder	0.3533	No Bid
WTP	5309 South State Road 13 Lapel, IN 46051	Southern Madison	Hydrofluorosilicic	23	11,250	wet lbs.	15 gal drum	No Bid	No Bid
WTP	2400 West State Road 28 Alexandria, IN 46001	Orestes	Chlorine	100	1,000	lbs.	150 lb. cylinder	0.3533	No Bid
W/WTP	7236 S. Mayflower Park Drive Zionsville, IN 46077	CTRWD	Liquid Alum	8	300,000	wet lbs.	250 gal tote	No Bid	No Bid
WTP/W/WTP	300 W. McKinley, Gaston, IN 47342	Gaston	Chlorine	100	2,000	lbs.	150 lb. cylinder	0.3533	No Bid
W/WTP	300 W. McKinley, Gaston, IN 47342	Gaston	Sulfur Dioxide	100	3,150	lbs.	150 lb. cylinder	1.00	No Bid
WTP	107 N. Sycamore, Gaston, IN 47342	Gaston	Potassium Permanganate		400	lbs.	50 lb. bucket	No Bid	No Bid
WTP	107 N. Sycamore, Gaston, IN 47342	Gaston	Sodium Fluoride	100	600	lbs.	50 lb. bag	0.78	No Bid
*	Minimum order of 1,000 gallons per purchase order								
**	Minimum order of 1,800 gallons per purchase order								