
Action Item#2:  Contracts/Leases:

The Public Works Department has reviewed the 12 bids and the lowest and most responsive bid is by 

Motz Group to install 15 fields (7 rectangle fields and 8 diamond fields) of synthetic turf.  The City 

Administration and Enterprise Division have reviewed the lease proposal from Motz Group which allows 

the city to lease the fields for 10 years and a very low rate and then purchase the fields for a dollar.  The 

bid tabulation spreadsheets labeled “BP 3-1 & 2- Synthetic Fields” are attached for complete bidding 

information. 



City of Westfield

Grand Park Bid Package III

BID PACKAGE #1

Baseball Synthetic Fields

Bidder's Name American Civil Hellas Construction Crider & Crider Mid America Golf ATG Ram Industries Byrne & Jones Sports Field Turf

Receipt of Addenda (1,2) y y y y y y y

Can Meet Schedule y y y y y y y

Properly Signed y y y y y y y

Financial Statement Included y y y y y y y

Non-Collusion Affidavit Included y y y y y y y

Bid Bond included y y y y y y y

BASE BID combo only 4,200,000.00$              4,786,800.00$              4,138,025.00$              no bid - combo only no bid - combo only 4,164,907.00$              

Alternate #1A Cost for 3 year financing no bid 100,380.00$                no bid 169,812.15$                246,213.00$                201,924.00$                

Alternate #1B Cost for 5 year financing no bid 100,380.00$                no bid 329,075.85$                384,121.00$                326,492.00$                

Alternate #1C Cost for 7 year financing no bid 104,580.00$                no bid 491,342.76$                571,053.00$                482,164.00$                

Alternate #1D Cost for 10 year financing no bid 117,180.00$                no bid 857,304.40$                948,337.00$                no bid

Alternate #1E Additional warranty costs no bid 80,000.00$                  126,000.00$                3,000.00$                    no bid

20' diameter home plate replacement $1,500.00 $3,500.00 $2,000.00 $700.00 $2,512.00 $5,000.00 $10,000.00

26' diameter home plate replacement $2,100.00 $4,200.00 $2,500.00 $1,200.00 $1,230.00 $7,000.00 $10,000.00

one bay batting tunnel complete $11,800.00 $16,730.00 $15,500.00 $17,065.00 $40,900.00 $18,000.00 $10,171.00

two bay batting tunnel complete $23,600.00 $33,474.00 $23,700.00 $25,800.00 $50,860.00 $27,000.00 $18,137.00

three bay batting tunnel complete $35,400.00 $53,070.00 $32,500.00 $34,285.00 $62,340.00 $35,000.00 $24,843.00

four bay batting tunnel complete $47,200.00 $74,900.00 $41,300.00 $44,000.00 $74,120.00 $43,000.00 $29,449.00

Combination Bid

Combination Bid Amt. 7,841,212.00$              7,500,000.00$              8,264,500.00$              7,483,300.00$              8,364,946.00$              7,994,000.00$              7,673,233.00$              
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City of Westfield

Grand Park Bid Package III

BID PACKAGE #2

Soccer Synthetic Fields

Bidder's Name American Civil Crider & Crider Hellas Construction Mid America Golf ATG Ram industries Byrne & Jones Sports Field Turf

Receipt of Addenda (1,2) see bp 1 y y y

Can Meet Schedule y y y

Properly Signed y y y

Financial Statement Included y y y

Non-Collusion Affidavit Included y y y

Bid Bond included y y y

BASE BID 3,527,700.00$              3,300,000.00$              3,421,950.00$              no bid 3,508,326.00$              

Alternate #2A Cost for 3 year financing no bid no bid 156,427.15$                215,137.00$                170,087.00$                

Alternate #2B Cost for 5 year financing no bid no bid 303,137.30$                332,346.00$                275,015.00$                

Alternate #2C Cost for 7 year financing no bid no bid 452,613.89$                490,876.00$                406,142.00$                

Alternate #2D Cost for 10 year financing no bid no bid 789,729.60$                808,199.00$                

Alternate #2E Additional warranty costs 70,000.00$                  no bid 110,250.00$                3,000.00$                    

Alternate #2F Shorten grass fibers (52,000.00)$                 (69,000.00)$                 no bid (59,200.00)$                 zero (70,680.00)$                 

Combination Bid

Combination Bid Amt.
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