
301-018-280 Debt Services
Indiana Dept of Transportation/3rd loan pmt $236,290.90

301-018-349 Services
Bernardin Lochmueller/Reg Detentin Permitting 1,500.30$           

Bernardin Lochmueller/Reg Detention Design 714.00$               

O.W. Krohn/Redevelopment Commission 11,606.25$         

Bernardin Lochmueller/Reg Detention Permitting 13,524.80$         

Bernardin Lochmueller/Reg Detention Design 238.00$               

Bernardin Lochmueller/Reg Detention Design 952.00$               

301-018-400 Land
 Fidelity National Titile/William & Sylvia Kirkman 201 
Mill Street $11,298.75

Old National Bank/Wilfong Parcel 6 & 9 $5,390.00

Sandee Enterprises Parcel 1 7,012.94$           

 Patsy Kunz Parcel 7 4,970.02$           

James & Sandra Wood 17,717.86$         

309-018-349 Eagletown Services
Butler Fairman & Seufert/Ditch Road 216,491.40$       

Butler Fairman & Seufert/Ditch Road 51,517.00$         

RDC Approval's 12/1/14
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Debra Tolley 
 


 


From: 


Sent: 


To: 


Cc: 


Subject: 


John Rogers 


Tuesday,April 29, 2014 5:42 PM 


Debra Tolley 


Micha Farrar; Kerri Gagnon 


RE: James Wood/Sandra Wood 


 
 


I am typing up letters to enclose with the checks, I will bring them over as soon as I have completed 


them.  Additionally the amounts will change. (see below) 
 


What time does the mail go out ? 


 


_Call me in the morning and I'll explain ...... 


From: Debra Tolley 


Sent: Tuesday, April 29, 2014 3:47 PM 


To: John Rogers 


Subject: RE: James Wood/Sandra Wood 


 


Indiana Bank and Trust $3675.00 Wilfong Parcel 6 and 9 $5,390 


Sandee  Enterprises  $4781.55 Parcel 1$7,012.94 


Patsy Kunz $3388.65 Parcel 7 $4,970.02 


 


 


'DefJra To((ey 


Clerk Treasurer Office 


Deputy Clerk 


(317) 804-3009 


dtolley@westfield.in.gov 


t;.- 
Cl'iY or 


Westfield 
I  NIJIANA 


 


 


 


From: John Rogers 


Sent: Tuesday, April 29, 2014 3:33 PM 


To: Debra Tolley 


Subject: RE: James Wood/Sandra Wood 


 
Here is the documentation. 


 
Please hold off mailing the others until I have a chance to talk to Matt. 


 
Can you send me a list of the persons, addresses and check amounts you are about to mail, 


please..... 


 


From: Debra Tolley 


Sent: Tuesday, April 29, 2014 3:25 PM 
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To: John Rogers 


Subject: RE: James Wood/Sandra Wood 


 
No they are in the mail for tomorrow though.  Did they go up as well? Do you have any documentation for the rate 


increase? 


 


 


'De6ra To{[e y 
Clerk Treasurer Office 


Deputy Clerk 


{317) 804-3009 


dtolley@westfiel d.in.gov 


,,'$;,,,, 
l;l1V 6r "\;  / 


Westfield 
JNOIANA 


 


 
 


From: John Rogers 


Sent: Tuesday, April 29, 2014 3:23 PM 


To: Debra Tolley 


Subject: RE: James Wood/Sandra Wood 


 
Debra: 


 
We have a new per acre rate this year.  At the new rate of $220/ac, his check should be for 


$17,717.86. 
 


Please contact Craig and let him know we can cut him a check for the delta. 


Have you sent the other checks yet? 


Thank you for catching this. 


 
John 


From: Debra Tolley 


Sent: Tuesday, April 29, 2014 2:36 PM 


To: John Rogers 


Subject: James Wood/Sandra Wood 


Hey John, 


Craig Wood was just here to pick up his May rent check. He said the amount was incorrect though. He said there was 


some renegotiating earlier this month and the amount was to increase starting in May. The amount we issued was 


$12,080.36.  He took the check and I told him I would find out and let him know. Can you please advise? 


Thank you. 


 


'De6ra 'Io{{ey 
Clerk Treasurer Office 


Deputy Clerk 


{317) 804-3009 
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Debra Tolley 
 


 


From: 


Sent: 


To: 


Cc: 


Subject: 


John Rogers 


Tuesday,April 29, 2014 5:42 PM 


Debra Tolley 


Micha Farrar; Kerri Gagnon 


RE: James Wood/Sandra Wood 


 
 


I am typing up letters to enclose with the checks, I will bring them over as soon as I have completed 


them.  Additionally the amounts will change. (see below) 
 


What time does the mail go out ? 


 


_Call me in the morning and I'll explain ...... 
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'DefJra To((ey 


Clerk Treasurer Office 


Deputy Clerk 


(317) 804-3009 


dtolley@westfield.in.gov 


t;.- 
Cl'iY or 


Westfield 
I  NIJIANA 


 


 


 


From: John Rogers 


Sent: Tuesday, April 29, 2014 3:33 PM 


To: Debra Tolley 


Subject: RE: James Wood/Sandra Wood 


 
Here is the documentation. 


 
Please hold off mailing the others until I have a chance to talk to Matt. 


 
Can you send me a list of the persons, addresses and check amounts you are about to mail, 


please..... 


 


From: Debra Tolley 


Sent: Tuesday, April 29, 2014 3:25 PM 
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To: John Rogers 


Subject: RE: James Wood/Sandra Wood 


 
No they are in the mail for tomorrow though.  Did they go up as well? Do you have any documentation for the rate 


increase? 


 


 


'De6ra To{[e y 
Clerk Treasurer Office 


Deputy Clerk 


{317) 804-3009 


dtolley@westfiel d.in.gov 


,,'$;,,,, 
l;l1V 6r "\;  / 


Westfield 
JNOIANA 


 


 
 


From: John Rogers 


Sent: Tuesday, April 29, 2014 3:23 PM 


To: Debra Tolley 


Subject: RE: James Wood/Sandra Wood 


 
Debra: 


 
We have a new per acre rate this year.  At the new rate of $220/ac, his check should be for 


$17,717.86. 
 


Please contact Craig and let him know we can cut him a check for the delta. 


Have you sent the other checks yet? 


Thank you for catching this. 


 
John 


From: Debra Tolley 


Sent: Tuesday, April 29, 2014 2:36 PM 


To: John Rogers 


Subject: James Wood/Sandra Wood 


Hey John, 


Craig Wood was just here to pick up his May rent check. He said the amount was incorrect though. He said there was 
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'De6ra 'Io{{ey 
Clerk Treasurer Office 


Deputy Clerk 


{317) 804-3009 
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From: 


Sent: 


To: 


Cc: 


Subject: 


John Rogers 


Tuesday,April 29, 2014 5:42 PM 


Debra Tolley 


Micha Farrar; Kerri Gagnon 


RE: James Wood/Sandra Wood 
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We have a new per acre rate this year.  At the new rate of $220/ac, his check should be for 


$17,717.86. 
 


Please contact Craig and let him know we can cut him a check for the delta. 


Have you sent the other checks yet? 
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From: John Rogers 


Sent: Tuesday, April 29, 2014 3:23 PM 
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Subject: RE: James Wood/Sandra Wood 


 
Debra: 
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